

ADDENDUM TO THE BID DOCUMENTS	Number of Pages: 1 of 1
<u>Addendum No:</u> # 1	<u>Date this Addendum Issued:</u> September 23, 2016
<u>Issuing Office:</u> Matanuska-Susitna Borough School District Purchasing Department 690 Cope Industrial Way Palmer, Alaska 99645 Phone: (907) 861-5120 Facsimile: (907) 861-5184	<u>Previous Addenda Issued:</u> None _____ _____ _____ _____
<u>Return Acknowledgment To:</u> Issuing Department	<u>Date and Hour of Bid Due Date:</u> October 4, 2016, 2:00 P.M., PALMER, AK TIME
<u>Bid Title:</u> Refuse Services for the Matanuska-Susitna Borough School District	<u>As Advertised (Frontiersman):</u> September 16 and 18, 2016
<u>Bid No:</u> B17-03	<u>As Advertised (ADN):</u> September 13 and 16, 2016
<p>The following corrections, changes, additions, deletions, revisions, and/or clarifications are hereby made a part of the Bid Documents. In case of conflicts between this Addendum and previously issued Documents, this Addendum shall take precedence.</p> <p><u>NOTE TO BIDDERS:</u> Please sign and return a copy of Addendum #1 with your bid. Failure to do so will be cause for rejection of your bid.</p> <p><i>Method of issuing Addendums: Addendums to this bid will be issued by U.S. Mail and facsimile.</i></p> <p>This addendum is being issued to provide clarification concerning this solicitation.</p> <p><u>QUESTIONS:</u></p> <p>1. This is a request to see the cost and price information from the previous bid awarded for refuse hauling services. <i>Answer: The Tabulation sheet for Bid #B15-04 is attached to this addendum as Appendix 1.</i></p> <p>2. We request the bid results for the bid prior to the previous bid. <i>Answer: The Tabulation Sheet for Bid #B06-02 is attached to this addendum as Appendix 2.</i></p> <p>3. What is the date that services would begin with the new bid, B17-03? <i>Answer: December 1, 2016</i></p> <p><i>All other terms and conditions remain the same and unchanged.</i></p> <p>I hereby acknowledge receipt of Addendum #1:</p> <p>Company Name: _____</p> <p>Mailing Address: _____</p> <p>Date: _____</p> <p>Signed By: _____ Signature and Title</p> <p>Printed Name: _____</p> <p style="text-align: center;">END OF ADDENDUM #1</p>	
APPROVED BY: Signature on File	DATE: September 23, 2016

SCHEDULE 1: WASILLA AREA

SCHOOL / SITE	SERVICE	ESTIMATED FREQUENCY/YEAR	ALASKA WASTE		DENALI REFUSE		NORSE ALASKA		RED BOX REFUSE		TALKEETNA REFUSE	
			Unit price	Total	Unit price	Total	Unit price	Total	Unit price	Total	Unit price	Total
Burchell High	35 yd.	12	\$ 104.96	\$ 1,259.52	Non-Responsive Bid		\$ 180.00	\$ 2,160.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Burchell Pace Portable	3 yd.	20	\$ 20.81	\$ 416.20			\$ 120.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 87.50	\$ 1,750.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Cottonwood Creek Elementary	33 yd.	10	\$ 69.83	\$ 698.30			\$ 120.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Finger Lake Elementary	33 yd.	10	\$ 91.94	\$ 919.40			\$ 120.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Fronteras Charter School	33 yd.	10	\$ 78.99	\$ 789.90			\$ 120.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Goose Bay Elementary	33 yd.	10	\$ 115.88	\$ 1,158.80			\$ 210.00	\$ 2,100.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Iditarod Elementary	33 yd.	42	\$ 89.84	\$ 3,773.28			\$ 150.00	\$ 6,300.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 9,450.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Knik Elementary	33 yd.	10	\$ 138.25	\$ 1,382.50			\$ 210.00	\$ 2,100.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Larson Elementary	33 yd.	20	\$ 88.65	\$ 1,773.00			\$ 150.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 4,500.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Mat-Su Career Tech High	33 yd.	12	\$ 81.03	\$ 972.36			\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	\$ -	No Bid	No Bid
Mat-Su Central School	6 yd.	52	\$ 35.37	\$ 1,839.24			\$ 120.00	\$ 6,240.00	\$ 41.00	\$ 2,132.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Mat-Su Day School	33 yd.	10	\$ 88.56	\$ 885.60			\$ 150.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Meadow Lakes Elementary	33 yd.	10	\$ 135.61	\$ 1,356.10			\$ 240.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
Operations & Maintenance	35 yd.	21	\$ 83.36	\$ 1,750.56			\$ 150.00	\$ 3,150.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 4,725.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Shaw Elementary	33 yd.	10	\$ 97.47	\$ 974.70			\$ 180.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Snowshoe Elementary	33 yd.	14	\$ 125.25	\$ 1,753.50			\$ 210.00	\$ 2,940.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 3,150.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Tanaina Elementary	33 yd.	16	\$ 90.92	\$ 1,454.72			\$ 180.00	\$ 2,880.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 3,600.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Teeland Middle	33 yd.	40	\$ 91.01	\$ 3,640.40			\$ 150.00	\$ 6,000.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 9,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Wasilla High	33 yd.	82	\$ 85.99	\$ 7,051.18			\$ 150.00	\$ 12,300.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 18,450.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Wasilla Middle	33 yd.	10	\$ 95.21	\$ 952.10			\$ 150.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid

SCHEDULE 2: PALMER AREA

SCHOOL / SITE	SERVICE	ESTIMATED FREQUENCY/YEAR	ALASKA WASTE		DENALI REFUSE		NORSE ALASKA		RED BOX REFUSE		TALKEETNA REFUSE	
			Unit price	Total	Unit price	Total	Unit price	Total	Unit price	Total	Unit price	Total
*Academy Charter	6 yd.	10	\$ 35.37	\$ 353.70	Non-Responsive Bid		\$ 120.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 1,750.00	No Bid	No Bid
Administration Building	33 yd.	10	\$ 85.45	\$ 854.50			\$ 120.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Birch Tree Charter	6 yd.	10	\$ 35.37	\$ 353.70			\$ 120.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 175.00	\$ 1,750.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Butte Elementary	33 yd.	10	\$ 123.65	\$ 1,236.50			\$ 150.00	\$ 1,500.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
Central Kitchen	33 yd.	10	\$ 81.05	\$ 810.50			\$ 120.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Colony High	33 yd.	82	\$ 50.96	\$ 4,178.72			\$ 120.00	\$ 9,840.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 18,450.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Colony Middle	33 yd.	25	\$ 64.22	\$ 1,605.50			\$ 120.00	\$ 3,000.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 5,625.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Machetanz Elementary	33 yd.	16	\$ 99.82	\$ 1,597.12			\$ 180.00	\$ 2,880.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 3,600.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Palmer High	33 yd.	52	\$ 65.26	\$ 3,393.52			\$ 120.00	\$ 6,240.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 11,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Palmer High Shop	33 yd.	52	\$ 65.26	\$ 3,393.52			\$ 120.00	\$ 6,240.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 11,700.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Palmer Jr. Middle	33 yd.	40	\$ 86.75	\$ 3,470.00			\$ 120.00	\$ 4,800.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 9,000.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Pioneer Peak Elementary	33 yd.	10	\$ 51.79	\$ 517.90			\$ 120.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Sherrod Elementary	33 yd.	10	\$ 83.52	\$ 835.20			\$ 120.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Sutton Elementary	3 yd.	24	\$ 20.81	\$ 499.44			\$ 120.00	\$ 2,880.00	\$ 98.00	\$ 2,352.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Swanson Elementary	33 yd.	20	\$ 72.16	\$ 1,443.20			\$ 120.00	\$ 2,400.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 4,500.00	No Bid	No Bid
Transportation Department	3 yd.	24	\$ 20.81	\$ 499.44			\$ 120.00	\$ 2,880.00	\$ 88.00	\$ 2,112.00	No Bid	No Bid
*Valley Pathways School	33 yd.	10	\$ 71.21	\$ 712.10			\$ 120.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid
Warehouse	30 yd.	10	\$ 73.51	\$ 735.10			\$ 120.00	\$ 1,200.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,250.00	No Bid	No Bid

SCHEDULE 3: NORTH VALLEY AREA													
SCHOOL / SITE	SERVICE	ESTIMATED FREQUENCY/YEAR	ALASKA WASTE		DENALI REFUSE		NORSE ALASKA		RED BOX REFUSE		TALKEETNA REFUSE		
			Unit price	Total	Unit price	Total	Unit price	Total	Unit price	Total	Unit price	Total	
*American Charter	3 yd.	92	\$ 20.81	\$ 1,914.52	Non-Responsive Bid		\$ 180.00	\$ 16,560.00	\$ 30.00	\$ 2,760.00	No Bid	No Bid	
*Beryozova School	96 gal.	40	\$ 30.50	\$ 1,220.00			\$ 240.00	\$ 9,600.00	\$ 98.00	\$ 3,920.00	No Bid	No Bid	
*Big Lake Elementary	33 yd.	14	\$ 201.80	\$ 2,825.20			\$ 300.00	\$ 4,200.00	\$ 282.00	\$ 3,948.00	No Bid	No Bid	
*Houston High	40 yd.	20	\$ 176.70	\$ 3,534.00			\$ 270.00	\$ 5,400.00	\$ 225.00	\$ 4,500.00	No Bid	No Bid	
*Houston Middle	33 yd.	10	\$ 174.60	\$ 1,746.00			\$ 270.00	\$ 2,700.00	\$ 282.00	\$ 2,820.00	No Bid	No Bid	
*Midnight Sun Charter	8 yd.	10	\$ 44.22	\$ 442.20			\$ 180.00	\$ 1,800.00	\$ 390.00	\$ 3,900.00	No Bid	No Bid	
*Su Valley Jr./Sr. High	33 yd.	14	\$ 281.26	\$ 3,937.64			\$ 720.00	\$ 10,080.00	\$ 563.00	\$ 7,882.00	\$ 327.00	\$ 4,578.00	
*Talkeetna Elementary	6 yd.	40	\$ 115.04	\$ 4,601.60	** NO AWARD MADE FOR THIS LINE ITEM (TALKEETNA ELEMENTARY SCHOOL) **							\$ 133.00	\$ 5,320.00
*Trapper Creek Elementary	2 yd.	40	\$ 128.55	\$ 5,142.00	** NO AWARD MADE FOR THIS LINE ITEM (TRAPPER CREEK ELEMENTARY SCHOOL) **							\$ 44.31	\$ 1,772.40
*Willow Elementary	33 yd.	6	\$ 252.78	\$ 1,516.68			\$ 480.00	\$ 2,880.00	\$ 394.00	\$ 2,364.00	No Bid	No Bid	

* These locations will operate on the school year calendar

PICK-UP AND CLEANING OF DUMPSTERS	ALASKA WASTE	DENALI REFUSE	NORSE ALASKA	RED BOX REFUSE	TALKEETNA REFUSE
1. 96 gal. Dumpster	\$ -	Non-Responsive Bid	\$ 300.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00
2. 2.0 cu. yd. Dumpster	\$ 35.00		\$ 300.00	\$ -	\$ 75.00
3. 3.0 cu. yd. Dumpster	\$ 35.00		\$ 300.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00
4. 6.0 cu. yd. Dumpster	\$ 35.00		\$ 300.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 75.00
5. 8.0 cu. yd. Dumpster	\$ 35.00		\$ 300.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 75.00
6. 30.0 cu. yd. Dumpster	\$ 125.00		\$ 300.00	\$ 75.00	\$ 150.00
7. 33.0 cu. yd. Dumpster	\$ 125.00		\$ 300.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00
8. 35.0 cu. yd. Dumpster	\$ 125.00		\$ 300.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00
9. 40.0 cu. yd. Dumpster	\$ 125.00		\$ 300.00	\$ 150.00	\$ 150.00

SUMMARY:

MATANUSKA SUSITNA BOROUGH SCHOOL DISTRICT
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
501 N. GULKANA
PALMER, ALASKA 99645

BID #B06-02
TITLE: REFUSE SERVICES
OPENING DATE: AUGUST 25, 2005 @ 1:00 P.M.

Item	Description		AK Waste Management		Valley Refuse		Talkeetna Refuse	
			Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
1.	Schedule 1: Wasilla Area		Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
Correspondence	52 pick-ups	3.0 cu yd Dumpster	\$20.00	\$1,040.00	\$23.12	\$1202.24	No Bid	No Bid
Cottonwood Crk, Finger Lake, Goose Bay, Iditarod, Larson, Meadow Lakes, Snowshoe, Tanaina, Teeland Middle, WHS, WMS	264 pick-ups	33.0 cu yd Dumpster	\$90.00	\$23,760.00	\$95.00	\$25,080.00		
Burchell High, Wasilla Maintenance Yard	32 pick-ups	35.0 cu yd Dumpster	\$90.00	\$2,880.00	\$95.00	\$3,040.00		
2.	Schedule 2: Palmer Area		Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
Valley Pathways, Warehouse	62 pick-ups	3.0 cu yd Dumpster	\$20.00	\$1,240.00	\$23.12	\$1,433.44	No Bid	No Bid
Academy Charter	10 pick-ups	6.0 cu yd Dumpster	\$34.00	\$340.00	\$44.57	\$445.70		
Admin Bldg, Butte, CHS, CMS, PHS, PHS shop, PJMS, Pioneer Peak, Sherrod, Swanson	311 pick-ups	33.0 cu yd Dumpster	\$90.00	\$27,990.00	\$95.00	\$29,545.00		
3.	Schedule 3: North Valley		Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
Trapper Creek	40 pick-ups	2.0 cu yd Dumpster	\$30.83	\$1,233.20	\$31.25	\$1,250.00	\$37.50	\$1,500.00

Mid-Valley, Sutton	132 pick-ups	3.0 cu yd Dumpster	\$20.00	\$2,640.00	\$23.12	\$3,051.84	No Bid	No Bid
3.	Schedule 3: North Valley (continued)		Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price	Unit Price	Total Price
Talkeetna	40 pick-ups	6.0 cu yd Dumpster	\$92.50	\$3,700.00	\$87.50	\$3,500.00	\$92.50	\$3,700.00
Midnight Sun	10 pick-ups	8.0 cu yd Dumpster	\$42.50	\$425.00	\$58.87	\$588.70	No Bid	No Bid
Big Lake, HMS, Su-Valley, Willow	44 pick-ups	33.0 cu yd Dumpster	\$150.00	\$6,600.00	\$155.16	\$6,827.04	No Bid	No Bid
HHS	20 pick-ups	40.0 cu yd Dumpster	\$150.00	\$3,000.00	\$99.00	\$1,980.00	No Bid	No Bid
TOTAL AMOUNT			\$74,848.20		\$77,943.96		\$5,200.00	

Summary:

Alaska Pacific Environmental Services Anchorage, LLC dba Alaska Waste was awarded Refuse Services of all areas in Schedule 1: Wasilla Area, all areas in Schedule 2: Palmer Area, and the following areas in Schedule 3: North Valley: Mid-Valley & Sutton (3.0 cu yd dumpsters), Midnight Sun (8.0 cu yd dumpster), and Big Lake, HMS, Su-Valley and Willow (33.0 cu yd dumpsters).

Valley Refuse was awarded Refuse Services in the following area in Schedule 3: North Valley: HHS (40.0 cu yd dumpster).

Talkeetna Refuse was awarded Refuse Services in the following areas in Schedule 3: North Valley: Trapper Creek Elementary (2.0 cu yd dumpster) and Talkeetna Elementary (6.0 cu yd dumpster). Alaska Pacific Environmental Services Anchorage, LLC dba Alaska Waster and Valley Refuse Services declined the award of refuse services in these areas, thus Talkeetna Refuse was awarded the bid for both school sites.